



TOMPKINS COUNTY

ROAD MATERIALS AND HIGHWAY SERVICES

2023 BID RESULTS

CONTRACT PERIOD

May 3, 2023 - May 31, 2024

LOWEST UNIT PRICE BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

2023 - ROCK SALT

2023 - DE-ICING & CONCRETE SAND - F.O.B.

2023 - CRUSHED GRAVEL AND GRAVEL MATERIAL

2023 - CRUSHED LIMESTONE AND LIMESTONE MATERIAL

2023 - LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

2023 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - VENDOR PLACED

2023 - FIBER REINFORCED BITUMINOUS MEMBRANE SURFACE TREATMENT

2023 - ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING - LONG LINES

2023 - INTERSECTION MARKING LINES, SYMBOLS AND LEGENDS - SHORT LINES

2023 - TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL

REBID

2023 - BRIDGE REPAIR

2023 - INFRASTRUCTURE CONSTRUCTION

**2023 - ROCK SALT
UNIT PRICE/TON**

ADDITIONAL delivery cost per ton to deliver any of products listed above to these Municipal Facilities:

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a Unit Price / Ton bid are shown	Item #1 Coarse Rock Salt F.O.B. Materials – at Vendor’s Location	Item #2 Coarse Rock Salt Delivered Materials – at Municipal Location
AMERICAN ROCK SALT CO., LLC *	\$45.00	\$63.50
CARGILL, INCORPARTED-SALT, ROD SAFETY	\$62.50	\$63.14

TC ITHACA	TC CASWELL	CAROLINE	DANBY	DRYDEN	ENFIELD	GROTON	ITHACA	LANSING	NEWFIELD	ULYSSES
N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

BIDDER	PIT LOCATION - FULL ADDRESS
AMERICAN ROCK SALT CO., LLC	Hampton Corners, NY
CARGILL, INCORP.-SALT, ROAD SAFETY	191 Portland Point Rd. Lansing, NY 14882

N/A = NOT AVAILABLE

* Minimum pick up is 10 tons.
Based on dump truck delivery (35-38 tons per delivery vehicle). Tri-axle truck requests (22 tons or less) will be an upcharge of \$2.30/ton or \$65.80/ton delivery.

**2023 - DE-ICING & CONCRETE SAND - F.O.B.
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a Unit Price / Ton bid are shown	Item #1 De-Icing Sand	Item #2 Concrete Sand
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 7.25	\$ 7.25
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC.	\$ 10.75	N/A
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$ 15.25	\$ 18.25

ADDITIONAL delivery cost per ton to deliver any of products listed above to these Municipal Facilities:

TC ITHACA	TC CASWELL	CAROLINE	DANBY	DRYDEN	ENFIELD	GROTON	ITHACA	LANSING	NEWFIELD	ULYSSES
\$ 6.25	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 12.75	\$ 6.25	\$ 10.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 8.00
A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R
\$ 8.00	\$ 9.10	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.60	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.80	\$ 7.50	\$ 10.40	\$ 10.40	\$ 9.30
\$ 7.95	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.50	\$ 10.70	\$ 6.80	\$ 13.60	\$ 6.80	\$ 8.95	\$ 8.40	\$ 13.95	\$ 16.95

BIDDER	PIT LOCATION - FULL ADDRESS
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	310 HILLVIEW DR, SPENCER NY 14883
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	VERRA DRIVE OFF OF RT 228
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC.	13 PERKINS RD BROOKTONDALE NY 14817
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	3779 RT 11 McGRAW, NY 13101

A/R = AVAILABLE UPON REQUEST

**2023 - CRUSHED GRAVEL AND GRAVEL MATERIAL
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a Unit Price / Ton bid are shown	#1A CRUSHED	VENDOR'S Material Designation	#1ST CRUSHED	VENDOR'S Material Designation	#1 CRUSHED	VENDOR'S Material Designation	#2 CRUSHED	VENDOR'S Material Designation	#4 CRUSHED	VENDOR'S Material Designation
DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING	\$ 23.00	#1A Stone	\$ 23.00	#1ST Stone	\$ 22.00	#1 Stone	\$ 22.00	#2 Stone	\$ 22.00	#4 Stone
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (O'TOOLES)	\$ 15.00	#1A Stone	N/A	N/A	\$ 15.00	#1 Stone	\$ 15.00	#2 Stone	N/A	N/A
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (GENOA)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 15.75	1A	N/A	N/A	\$ 15.50	#1	\$ 14.75	#2	N/A	N/A
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 14.00	TC1A	N/A	N/A	\$ 12.00	TC1	\$ 12.00	TC2	\$ 12.25	TC3
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 12.25	TC1	\$ 12.25	TC2	N/A	N/A
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 12.75	CCRS1	\$ 12.25	CCRS2	NO BID	NO BID
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	\$ 14.75	UCRS1AW (WASHED)	\$ 15.50	UCRS1STW WASHED	\$ 15.50	UCRS1W WASHED	\$ 13.50	UCRSR2W WASHED	NO BID	NO BID
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$ 24.75	50745	\$ 23.00	70750	\$ 20.50	50755	\$ 20.50	50760	NO BID	NO BID

* TYPE 4 modified specifications meet TYPE 4 crushed bank run gravel except only 0-5% may pass #200 sieve.

N/A = NOT AVAILABLE

A/R = AVAILABLE UPON REQUEST

**2023 - CRUSHED GRAVEL AND GRAVEL MATERIAL
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER	TYPE 4 CRUSH BANK RUN	VENDOR'S Material Designation	TYPE 4* CRUSH GRAVEL	VENDOR'S Material Designation	TYPE 4 SCREEN BANK RUN	VENDOR'S Material Designation	BANK RUN	VENDOR'S Material Designation	MED STONE FIL	VENDOR'S Material Designation
DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (O'TOOLES)	\$ 8.00	Crushed Gravel	N/A	N/A	\$ 6.50	Screened Gravel	\$ 5.50	Bank Run Gravel	\$ 12.00	Large Gabion
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (GENOA)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 6.50	Screened Gravel	\$ 5.50	Bank Run Gravel	\$ 12.00	Large Gabion
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 8.50	Bank Run 2" minus	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 7.00	Bank Run	N/A	N/A
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 7.25	TC4	\$ 9.50	TMC4	\$ 5.25	TS4	\$ 4.75	TBRG	\$ 25.00	TMSF
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 7.25	TC4	N/A	N/A	\$ 3.90	TS4	\$ 4.75	TBRG	N/A	N/A
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR)	\$ 7.50	CCBRN	\$ 12.00	CCRRN	\$ 5.75	CITEM4	\$ 6.50	CBRG	NO BID	NO BID
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER)	\$ 7.75	SCBRN	\$ 13.00	SCRRN	\$ 6.00	SITEM4	\$ 7.00	SBRG	NO BID	NO BID
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	\$ 11.00	UCBRN	\$ 15.75	UCRRN	\$ 9.25	UITEM4	\$ 9.50	UBRG	NO BID	NO BID
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE)	\$ 7.50	ACBRN	\$ 12.25	ACRRN	\$ 5.75	AITEM4	\$ 6.50	ABRG	NO BID	NO BID
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

**2023 - CRUSHED GRAVEL AND GRAVEL MATERIAL
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER	GABION STONE	VENDOR'S Material Designation	SELECT FILL 203.06	VENDOR'S Material Designation	SELECT GRANULAR FILL 203.08	VENDOR'S Material Designation
DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (O'TOOLES)	\$ 10.50	Gabion	\$ 6.50	Sandy Bank Run	N/A	N/A
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (GENOA)	\$ 10.50	Gabion	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	N/A	N/A	\$ 8.50	Select	\$ 8.25	Select Granular
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 25.00	TGS	\$ 4.75	TSF	\$ 4.75	TSGF
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	N/A	N/A	\$ 3.90	TSF	\$ 3.90	TSGF
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR)	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5.75	CSFILL	\$ 5.75	CITEM4
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER)	\$ 12.00	SLSF	\$ 6.00	SITEM4	\$ 6.00	SITEM4
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.25	UITEM4	\$ 9.25	UITEM4
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE)	\$ 11.75	ALSF	\$ 5.75	AITEM4	\$ 5.75	AITEM4
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

**2023 - CRUSHED GRAVEL AND GRAVEL MATERIAL
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER	TC ITHACA	TC CASWELL	CAROLINE	DANBY	DRYDEN	ENFIELD	GROTON	ITHACA	LANSING	NEWFIELD	ULYSSES
DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (O'TOOLES)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (GENOA)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 10.50	\$ 6.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 13.25	\$ 6.55	\$ 13.25	\$ 8.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 9.30	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 6.25	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 12.75	\$ 6.25	\$ 10.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 8.00
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R	A/R
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR)	\$ 9.95	\$ 11.70	\$ 6.75	\$ 5.25	\$ 10.80	\$ 10.80	\$ 14.30	\$ 8.50	\$ 12.35	\$ 9.50	\$ 11.70
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER)	\$ 7.40	\$ 13.00	\$ 9.75	\$ 7.00	\$ 12.55	\$ 8.40	\$ 14.30	\$ 9.00	\$ 11.25	\$ 6.75	\$ 10.80
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.10	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.60	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 7.50	\$ 10.40	\$ 10.40	\$ 9.30
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE)	\$ 9.30	\$ 10.15	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.00	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.60	\$ 12.10	\$ 8.40	\$ 10.80	\$ 10.80	\$ 10.15
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.50	\$ 10.70	\$ 6.80	\$ 13.60	\$ 6.80	\$ 8.95	\$ 8.40	\$ 13.95	\$ 16.95

ADDITIONAL delivery cost per ton to deliver any of products listed above to these Municipal Facilities:

**2022 - Crushed Gravel and Gravel Material
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER	PIT LOCATION: (FULL ADDRESS)
DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING	127 CHEMUNG FLATS RD, CHEMUNG, NY 14825
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (O'TOOLES)	70 OAK HILL RD MORAVIA, NY 13118
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL (GENOA)	3046 BLAKELY RD, GENOA NY 13071
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	290 MOTT RD DRYDEN, NY 13053
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	310 HILLVIEW RD SPENCER, NY 14883
ODESSA SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	Verra Drive Off of Rt 228
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (CANDOR)	535 ITHACA RD CANDOR, NY 13743
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (SPENCER)	205 LAKE ROAD SPENCER, NY 14883
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	13 PERKINS ROAD BROOKTONDALE, NY 14817
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (WILLSEYVILLE)	285 CODDINGTON ROAD WILLSEYVILLE, NY 13864
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	3779 RT 11 MCGRAW NY 13101

**2023 - CRUSHED LIMESTONE AND LIMESTONE MATERIAL
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a Unit Price / Ton bid are shown	#1A CRUSHED	#1B CRUSHED	#1ST CRUSHED	#1 CRUSHED	#2 CRUSHED	#3 CRUSHED	#4 CRUSHED	LIMESTONE MIX	CRUSHER DUST	LIMESTONE (2" MINUS)	LIMESTONE (1.5" MINUS)	RIP RAP (AVE)	RIP RAP (SELECT)	GABION STONE
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 21.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25	\$ 20.00	\$ 19.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 26.50	\$ 32.45	\$ 24.00
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	--	--	--	--	--	\$15.50 *	--	--	--	\$15.50 *	--	--	--	--
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 21.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 21.00

Modified TYPE 2 specifications meet TYPE 2 crusher run limestone except 100% pass 1 1/2" sieve.

* Angelo's Notes : "We have Type 2 Ledge Rock Material

ADDITIONAL delivery cost per ton to deliver any of products listed above to these Municipal Facilities

BIDDER - STONE	TC ITHACA	TC CASWELL	CAROLINE	DANBY	DRYDEN	ENFIELD	GROTON	ITHACA	LANSING	NEWFIELD	ULYSSES	PIT LOCATION: (FULL ADDRESS)
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 18.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 18.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 18.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 18.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 20.50	4800 RD, JAMESVILLE NY; NYS RT 321
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 6.25	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 12.75	\$ 6.25	\$ 10.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 8.00	310 HILLVIEW RD SPENCER, NY 14883
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.10	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.60	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.50	\$ 7.50	\$ 10.40	\$ 10.40	\$ 9.30	13 PERKINS ROAD BROOKTONDALE, NY
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	\$ 11.00	\$ 12.50	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 10.00	2747 CANOGA RD SENECA FALLS NY

ADDITIONAL delivery cost per ton to deliver any of products listed above to these Municipal Facilities

BIDDER - RIP RAP	TC ITHACA	TC CASWELL	CAROLINE	DANBY	DRYDEN	ENFIELD	GROTON	ITHACA	LANSING	NEWFIELD	ULYSSES	PIT LOCATION: (FULL ADDRESS)
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 24.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 24.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 20.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 20.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.50	4800 RD, JAMESVILLE NY; NYS RT 321
ANGELO'S SAND & GRAVEL - PAOLANGELI	\$ 6.25	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 12.75	\$ 6.25	\$ 10.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 8.00	310 HILLVIEW RD SPENCER, NY 14883
H.L. ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL, INC (BROOKTONDALE)	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	13 PERKINS ROAD BROOKTONDALE, NY
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	2747 CANOGA RD SENECA FALLS NY

2023 - LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown

CATEGORY A	ITEM # 1 RS-2	ITEM # 2 HFRS-2	ITEM # 3 CRS-2	ITEM # 4 HFMS-2ST	ITEM # 5 CMS-2ST	ITEM # 6 RS-2P	ITEM # 7 HFRS-2P	ITEM # 8 CRS-2P
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$ 2.12	\$ 2.14	\$ 2.34	\$ 2.67	\$ 2.76	\$ 2.21	\$ 2.29	\$ 2.41
VESTAL ASPHALT	\$ 2.155	\$ 2.316	\$ 2.216	\$ 2.666	\$ 2.716	\$ 2.355	\$ 2.916	\$ 2.415

CATEGORY A	ITEM # 9 MS-2	ITEM # 10 HFMS-2	ITEM # 11 CMS-2	ITEM # 12 HFMS-2Gh	ITEM # 13 TACK COAT	ITEM # 14 AEP-M	ITEM # 15 CPE-WS	ITEM # 16 CPE-SS
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$2.81	\$2.89	\$3.09	\$2.77	\$10.25	\$2.16	\$3.55	\$3.50
VESTAL ASPHALT	\$3.07	\$2.74	\$3.12	\$3.22	\$10.00	\$2.50	\$3.35	\$3.25

CATEGORY A	ITEM # 17 HFMS-2GWS	ITEM # 21 HFMS-2h	ITEM # 24 * Hyper Patch Liquid	ITEM # 25 *SKMOD
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$3.35	\$2.90	NO BID	\$4.44
VESTAL ASPHALT	\$3.26	\$2.97	\$4.85	NO BID

CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT BID PRICE PER DAY RENTAL BIDDER	ITEM # 26 PUGMILL	ITEM # 27 VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT ROLLER (W/ OPERATOR)	ITEM # 28 AUTOMATED PAVER	ITEM # 29 SELF PROPELLED VARIABLE WIDTH AGGREGATE SPREADER	ITEM # 30 TWIN DRUM VIBRATORY ROLLER	ITEM # 31 PNEUMATIC RUBBER TIRE ROLLER (W/ OPER)	ITEM # 32 COLD RECYCLER / STABILIZER / REPROFILER
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$2,400.00	\$2,500.00	\$3,400.00	\$2,100.00	\$2,300.00	\$2,050.00	\$6,600.00
VESTAL ASPHALT	\$2,300.00	\$2,500.00	\$3,500.00	\$2,300.00	\$2,200.00	\$1,950.00	\$6,350.00

BID PRICES ARE REQUESTED FOR RENTAL, PER DAY, FOR THE FOLLOWING EQUIPMENT IN CONJUNCTION WITH LIQUID ASPHALT PROJECTS:
EQUIPMENT RENTAL IS CONSIDERED INCIDENTAL TO LIQUID PRODUCTS AND IS NOT A BASIS FOR AWARD.

CATEGORY C COLD MIX ASPHALT PAVEMENT	COLD MIX ASPHALT PAVEMENT (PER TON)	STABILIZED AGGREGATES (PER TON)
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$55.84	\$47.84
VESTAL ASPHALT	NO BID	NO BID

CATEGORY D FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION OF ASPHALT PAVEMENT (SQ. YARD)	FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION OF ASPHALT PAVEMENT
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$4.48
VESTAL ASPHALT	\$1.70

**2023 - WARM MIX ASPHALT - VENDOR PLACED
UNIT PRICE/TON**

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a Unit Price / Ton bid are shown	6.3 mm F2 TOP COURSE	6.3 mm F3 TOP COURSE	9.5 mm F2 TOP COURSE	9.5 mm F3 TOP COURSE	9.5 mm F9 TRUE & LEVELING COURSE	12.5 mm F2 TOP COURSE	12.5 mm F3 TOP COURSE	12.5 mm F9 TRUE & LEVELING COURSE	19 mm F9 BINDER COURSE	25 mm F9 BINDER COURSE	37.5 mm F9 BASE COURSE
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS INC	\$ 78.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 71.25	\$ 71.25	\$ 71.25	\$ 71.25	\$ 69.00	\$ 69.00
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 99.50	\$ 99.50	\$ 96.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 92.65	\$ 88.75	\$ 88.75	\$ 87.85	\$ 83.85	\$ 81.25	\$ 77.85
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	\$ 81.00	\$ 81.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 70.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.50	\$ 64.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 61.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$ 86.00	\$ 86.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 67.25	\$ 65.25	\$ 63.25

ADDITIONAL delivery cost per ton to deliver any of products listed above to these Municipal Facilities

BIDDER	TC ITHACA	TC CASWELL	CAROLINE	DANBY	DRYDEN	ENFIELD	GROTON	ITHACA	LANSING	NEWFIELD	ULYSSES
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS INC	\$ 13.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 10.75	\$ 10.75	\$ 7.90	\$ 16.00	\$ 11.25	\$ 14.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 22.50
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.50	\$ 16.00	\$ 15.50	\$ 13.00	\$ 15.50	\$ 12.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 10.00
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.95	\$ 7.50	\$ 10.70	\$ 6.80	\$ 13.60	\$ 6.80	\$ 8.95	\$ 8.40	\$ 13.95	\$ 16.95

BIDDER	PIT LOCATION - FULL ADDRESS
BROOME-TIOGA BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS INC	3818 ST RT 17C TIOGA, NY 13845
LEHIGH HANSON (HEIDELBERG MATERIALS)	87 PORTLAND POINT ROAD LANSING, NY
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	2754 CANOGA ROAD SENECA, NY 13148
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	3779 RT 11 McGRAW, NY 13101

**2023 - FIBER REINFORCED BITUMINOUS MEMBRANE SURFACE TREATMENT
UNIT PRICE / SY**

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown	SQUARE YARD RANGE					
	1-5,000 SY/DAY	5,000- 10,000 SY/DAY	10,001- 20,000 SY/DAY	10,001- 20,000 SY/DAY	20,001- 40,000 SY/DAY	40,000+ SY/DAY
FIBERMAT TYPE A						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 4.22	\$ 2.98	\$ 2.48	N/A	\$ 2.29	\$ 0.21
FIBERMAT TYPE B						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 4.17	\$ 2.89	\$ 2.43	N/A	\$ 2.24	\$ 2.01
OPTION A						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 0.74	\$ 0.65	\$ 0.575	N/A	\$ 0.575	\$ 0.575
OPTION B						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 0.435	\$ 0.22	\$ 0.165	N/A	\$ 0.11	\$ 0.075
OPTION C						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 0.37	\$ 0.18	\$ 0.115	N/A	\$ 0.08	\$ 0.05
OPTION D						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 0.80	\$ 0.53	\$ 0.265	N/A	\$ 0.205	\$ 0.125
OPTION E						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 0.37	\$ 0.18	\$ 0.12	N/A	\$ 0.08	\$ 0.05
OPTION F						
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	\$ 0.62	\$ 0.31	\$ 0.21	N/A	\$ 0.13	\$ 0.08

Optional additional items (if Agency elects to require Contractor to provide any or all of these items).

Option A: If contractor furnishes and delivers aggregate to aggregate chip spreader.

Option B: If contractor furnishes and operates self-propelled aggregate chip spreader.

Option C: If contractor furnishes and operates pneumatic tired roller (per roller).

Option D: If contractor furnishes maintenance & protection of traffic as per MUTCD.

Option E: If contractor furnishes and operates steel wheel roller (per roller).

Option F: If contractor furnishes and operates self-propelled broom or vacuum sweeper.

N/A = NOT AVAILABLE

2023 - ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING - LONG LINES

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown	ITEM 1 DOUBLE CENTERLINE UNIT PRICE PER MILE	ITEM 1 TOTAL	ITEM 2 SINGLE EDGELINE UNIT PRICE PER MILE	ITEM 2 TOTAL	ITEM 3 AEXCEL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON	ITEM 3 AEXCEL TOTAL	ITEM 3 BALTIMORE UNIT PRICE PER GALLON	ITEM 3 BALTIMORE TOTAL
---	--	-----------------	--	-----------------	--	---------------------------	---	------------------------------

O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 498.00	\$ 109,560.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 56,250.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 545.00	\$ 119,900.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 58,500.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.50

Mobilization to Tompkins County, * one time for bid purposes, two or three times anticipated.

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown	ITEM 4 AEXCEL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON	ITEM 4 AEXCEL TOTAL	ITEM 4 BALTIMORE UNIT PRICE PER GALLON	ITEM 4 BALTIMORE TOTAL	ITEM 5 REFLECTOR GLASS BEADS UNIT PRICE PER POUND	ITEM 5 TOTAL	ITEM 6 INDEXING UNIT PRICE PER MILE	ITEM 6 TOTAL
---	--	---------------------------	---	------------------------------	---	-----------------	--	-----------------

O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.50	\$ 1.50	\$ 45.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 0.48	\$ 0.48	\$ 5.00	\$ 150.00

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown	ITEM 7 MOBILIZE 0-10 MILES TOTAL	ITEM 8 MOBILIZE 10-20 MILES TOTAL
O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 500.00	\$ -
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ -	\$ -

BIDDER Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown PASSING AND NO-PASSING ZONE LOCATION	PRICE/MILE
O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 850.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 850.00

2023 - INTERSECTION MARKING LINES, SYMBOLS AND LEGENDS - SHORT LINES

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown CATEGORY A	ITEM 1 24" WIDE STOP BAR \$ LF	ITEM 1 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 2 4" WIDE STRAIGHT CURVED LINES	ITEM 2 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 3 STRAIGHT ARROW \$ EA	ITEM 3 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 4 TURN ARROW \$ EA	ITEM 4 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 5 STRAIGHT W/ TURN ARROW \$ EA	ITEM 5 SUB TOTAL
O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 4.17	\$ 3,369.36	\$ 0.10	\$ 2,680.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 720.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 2,040.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 400.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 5.00	\$ 4,040.00	\$ 0.75	\$ 20,100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 3,400.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 500.00

Mobilization to Tompkins County, * one time for bid purposes, two or three times anticipated.

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown CATEGORY A (Cont'd)	ITEM 6 LEGEND (ONLY) \$ EA	ITEM 6 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 7 6" WIDE CROSS WALK \$ LF	ITEM 7 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 8 8" WIDE CROSS WALK \$ LF	ITEM 8 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 9 12" WIDE CROSS DIAGONAL \$ LF	ITEM 9 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 10 24" WIDE CROSS DIAGONAL \$ LF	ITEM 10 SUB TOTAL
O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 120.00	\$ 960.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 2.50	\$ 250.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 6,255.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 7,500.00

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown CATEGORY A (Cont'd)	ITEM 11 RAIL ROAD CROSSING \$ EA	ITEM 11 SUB TOTAL
O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 375.00	\$ 1,500.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 500.00	\$ 2,000.00

Award of bid will be based on bid TOTAL

CATEGORY B: Yellow Setfast Alkyd or Waterborne Paint with standard beads, minimum 15 wet mils thickness.	ITEM 21 4" WIDE CENTER LINES \$ LF	ITEM 21 SUB TOTAL	ITEM 22 24" WIDE DIAGONAL LINES \$ LF	ITEM 22 SUB TOTAL
O.H. STRIPING INC	\$ 0.10	\$ 740.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 4,170.00
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	\$ 0.75	\$ 5,550.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 5,000.00

2023 - TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL

BIDDER	NO BIDS
CATEGORY A: TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL (CONTRACTOR TO REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF ALL WOOD AND DEBRIS)	
CATEGORY B: TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL (OWNER TO PICK UP AND DISPOSE OF ALL STACKED WOOD AND DEBRIS)	
CATEGORY C: TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL (CONTRACTOR TO REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF ALL WOOD AND DEBRIS)	
BROOME BITUMINOUS PRODUCTS INC	NO BID
DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING	NO BID
ELMIRA ROAD MATERIAL	NO BID
GENOA SAND & GRAVEL	NO BID
LEHIGH HANSON	NO BID
MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS	NO BID
O.H. STRIPING INC	NO BID
PAOLANGELI	NO BID
R.B. ROBINSON CONTRACTING INC	NO BID
SENECA PAVEMENT MARKING INC	NO BID
SENECA STONE CORPORATION	NO BID
SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION	NO BID
TOWN & COUNTRY BRIDGE AND RAIL INC	NO BID
VESTAL ASPHALT	NO BID

2023 - BRIDGE REPAIR

BIDDER NOTE: Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown	A	B	B	C	C	D	D	ITEM (A+B+C+D) TOTAL
	ITEM A MOBILIZE PER SITE	ITEM B FORMAN PER HOUR	ITEM B FORMAN 120 HRS TOTAL	ITEM C CARP IRON PER HOUR	ITEM C CARP IRON 240 HRS TOTAL	ITEM D LABORER PER HOUR	ITEM D LABORER 240 HRS TOTAL	
SILVERLINE CONSTRUCTION INC.	\$ 300.00	\$ 104.50	\$ 12,540	\$ 104.00	\$ 24,960	\$ 97.50	\$ 23,400	\$ 61,200
TOWN AND COUNTY BRIDGE AND RAIL INC	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 13,080	\$ 99.00	\$ 23,760	\$ 97.00	\$ 23,280	\$ 62,020

2023 - INFRASTRUCTURE CONSTRUCTION

BIDDER Only Vendors submitting a bid are shown	SILVERLINE CONSTRUCTION INC.		TOWN & COUNTY BRIDGE AND RAIL INC		
	UNIT	unit price	mobile	unit price	mobile
		HR	LS	HR	LS
PROJECT MOBILIZATION					
PROJECT MOBILIZATION	--	\$300.00	--	\$1,900.00	
REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION STAFF					
FOREMAN	\$104.50	--	\$109.00	--	
JOURNEYMAN CARPENTER	\$104.00	--	\$99.00	--	
IRON WORKER	\$104.50	--	\$99.00	--	
LABORER	\$97.50	--	\$97.00	--	
EQUIPMENT OPERATOR	\$135.25	--	\$107.00	--	
EQUIPMENT RIGGER	\$104.00	--	\$97.00	--	
REQUIRED HEAVY HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT					
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH THUMB (20 TON)	\$185	\$500	--	--	
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH HAMMER (20 TON)	\$195	\$500	--	--	
TRACK DOZER (75 HP)	\$165	\$400	--	--	
TRACTOR BACKHOE LOADER (75 HP)	\$165	\$400	--	--	
HYDRAULIC TRUCK CRANE (75 TON)	\$425	\$1,000	--	--	
HYDRAULIC TRUCK CRANE (160 TON)	\$475	\$1,500	--	--	
ROUGH TERRAIN HYDRAULIC CRANE (70 TON)	\$335	\$1,100	--	--	
MOTOR GRADER (200 HP)	NO BID	NO BID	--	--	
SKID STEER (75 H)	\$160	\$400	--	--	
4 WD WHEEL LOADER (4.75 CY)	\$165	\$425	--	--	
DUMP TRUCK (14 CY)	\$130	NA	--	--	
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH THUMB	\$205	\$650	--	--	
TRUCK MOUNTED RAIL POST DRIVER	\$160	\$400	\$434	\$4,900	
VIBRATING DRUM HIGHWAY ROLLER	\$160	\$400	--	--	
VIBRATING TRENCH ROLLER	NO BID	NO BID	--	--	
4WD TELEHANDLER BOOM LIFT	\$160	\$400	--	--	
40 TON RT CRANE	\$170	\$840	--	--	
FIELD TRUCK WITH TOOLS	\$40	N/A	--	--	
CX 80 EXCAVATOR WITH THUMB	\$165	\$400	--	--	
CX 145 EXCAVATOR WITH THUMB	\$170	\$400	--	--	
CX 60 EXCAVATOR WITH HAMMER	\$165	\$400	--	--	
SKIDSTEER & GRADER BLADE ROBOTIC	\$190	\$400	--	--	
HYDRAULIC 200 TON CRANE	\$480	\$1,600	--	--	
HYDRAULIC 250 TON CRANE	\$500	\$1,800	--	--	
HYDRAULIC 300 TON CRANE	\$525	\$2,000	--	--	
1150 DOZER	\$185	\$500	--	--	
SKIDSTEER 7 SAW	\$170	\$400	--	--	